
Appendix 2

SCHEDULE OF APPLICATIONS FOR THE USE OF THE CITY HALL AND 
THE PROVISION OF HOSPITALITY

Organisation 
/ Body

Event / Date – 
Number of 
Delegates / 
Guests

Request Comments Recommendation

Northern Ireland 
Youth Forum

The Big Deal – A 
programme for 
Children and 
Young People

24th September, 
2010

Approximately 70 
attending

The use of the 
City Hall and the  
provision of 
hospitality in the 
form of tea/coffee 
and biscuits.

The Big Deal Programme 
sought to enable children and 
young people to become 
more involved in the 
decision-making process.

This event seeks to 
recognise the significant 
achievement of the children 
and young people who have 
successfully completed the 
programme.  

Furthermore, the event will 
acknowledge the contribution 
made by the participants in 
terms of good relations, 
promoting civic participation 
and community development 
across the city

This event would contribute 
to the Council’s Key Themes 
of ‘City Leadership - strong, 
fair, together’ and ‘Better 
support for people and 
communities.

The use of Belfast 
Castle and the provision 
of hospitality in the form 
of tea/coffee and 
biscuits.

Approximate cost £105


